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D Y N D Y N D Y N D Y N D Y N Puan
Genel Ortalama 9.47 9.09 7.20 11.31 7.34 9.47 4.57 4.89 3.35 5.38 8.19 3.33 30.73 29.52 23.35 193.417

İl Ortalaması 9.41 8.90 7.19 11.44 7.28 9.62 4.39 4.61 3.24 5.18 8.00 3.18 30.43 28.79 23.23 192.920
Okul Ortalaması 11.80 8.28 9.73 12.47 6.62 10.81 5.60 5.87 4.14 6.42 9.42 4.07 36.29 30.18 28.75 214.992
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1 49 - KAMURAN BARAÇ 10 / B 21 3 20.25 20 3 19.25 16 7 14.25 16 8 14.00 73.00 21.00 67.75 371.000 32 17 16 1
2 82 - MERYEM BULUT 10 / C 12 9 9.75 12 6 10.50 19 5 17.75 20 3 19.25 63.00 23.00 57.25 329.000 111 66 60 2
3 75 - YUSUF EMREKÖSE 10 / F 18 6 16.50 15 8 13.00 18 2 17.50 12 9 9.75 63.00 25.00 56.75 327.000 115 68 62 3
4 86 - SUKEYNA AYTEKİN 10 / C 21 4 20.00 16 9 13.75 12 13 8.75 16 9 13.75 65.00 35.00 56.25 325.000 120 70 64 4
5 232 - NAİM 10 / F 19 4 18.00 20 0 20.00 12 4 11.00 10 12 7.00 61.00 20.00 56.00 324.000 123 71 65 5
6 211 - ÖMER YOLCU 10 / D 18 3 17.25 16 2 15.50 11 1 10.75 13 7 11.25 58.00 13.00 54.75 319.000 135 77 71 6
7 24 - ÖMER AVCI 10 / A 18 4 17.00 18 1 17.75 12 7 10.25 11 7 9.25 59.00 19.00 54.25 317.000 141 81 75 7
8 12 - M FURKAN ÖZDEMİR 10 / F 16 9 13.75 15 8 13.00 13 8 11.00 14 9 11.75 58.00 34.00 49.50 298.000 197 113 99 8
9 61 - AHMET HALİT 10 / B 20 1 19.75 14 5 12.75 5 5 3.75 13 5 11.75 52.00 16.00 48.00 292.000 224 125 108 9

10 31 - TUANA BAYTÜZ 10 / A 14 8 12.00 17 7 15.25 11 5 9.75 13 8 11.00 55.00 28.00 48.00 292.000 224 125 108 9
11 235 - BEYZA KAYDU 10 / E 16 5 14.75 17 4 16.00 6 1 5.75 9 2 8.50 48.00 12.00 45.00 280.000 266 146 124 11
12 92 - ECRİN BATARAY 10 / C 17 7 15.25 15 5 13.75 11 8 9.00 10 14 6.50 53.00 34.00 44.50 278.000 276 151 126 12
13 78 - BEYZA YILDIRIM 10 / C 19 4 18.00 12 7 10.25 12 8 10.00 9 12 6.00 52.00 31.00 44.25 277.000 280 153 128 13
14 265 - FATİH ERYATAN 10 / A 15 4 14.00 19 2 18.50 6 9 3.75 9 8 7.00 49.00 23.00 43.25 273.000 294 163 136 14
15 85 - YEL* KUTULMAN 10 / C 15 4 14.00 14 6 12.50 8 7 6.25 11 7 9.25 48.00 24.00 42.00 268.000 338 191 156 15
16 240 - ALPEREN GENGÖRÜ 10 / E 20 3 19.25 16 8 14.00 7 12 4.00 8 14 4.50 51.00 37.00 41.75 267.000 343 193 157 16
17 239 - MERVE DOĞAN 10 / E 15 4 14.00 17 1 16.75 4 2 3.50 8 2 7.50 44.00 9.00 41.75 267.000 343 193 157 16
18 283 - BERKAN KÖSE 10 / D 10 11 7.25 17 4 16.00 10 8 8.00 13 11 10.25 50.00 34.00 41.50 266.000 351 197 161 18
19 39 - HAYRUNİSA ÇEÇEN 10 / A 15 6 13.50 16 7 14.25 11 5 9.75 7 13 3.75 49.00 31.00 41.25 265.000 359 203 167 19
20 66 - ÖMER BOZKURT 10 / A 12 10 9.50 18 3 17.25 9 4 8.00 8 9 5.75 47.00 26.00 40.50 262.000 380 212 174 20
21 218 - İLKNUR KAYA 10 / D 13 7 11.25 16 2 15.50 9 6 7.50 9 12 6.00 47.00 27.00 40.25 261.000 386 214 176 21
22 4 - ALPEREN KARAKÖSE 10 / A 14 5 12.75 15 3 14.25 8 1 7.75 6 5 4.75 43.00 14.00 39.50 258.000 407 228 186 22
23 41 - YUSUF EMREKILIÇ 10 / A 12 2 11.50 13 4 12.00 9 7 7.25 10 10 7.50 44.00 23.00 38.25 253.000 437 240 195 23
24 107 - BERFİN ŞENLİK 10 / C 15 7 13.25 13 10 10.50 10 11 7.25 10 12 7.00 48.00 40.00 38.00 252.000 444 245 198 24
25 7 - ELİF HEKİMOĞLU 10 / A 16 5 14.75 15 7 13.25 7 0 7.00 6 12 3.00 44.00 24.00 38.00 252.000 444 245 198 24
26 145 - NİDA KAYMAZALP 10 / F 14 8 12.00 17 4 16.00 5 9 2.75 9 12 6.00 45.00 33.00 36.75 247.000 488 267 216 26
27 29 - YÜSRA AZRAK 10 / A 19 3 18.25 13 9 10.75 4 4 3.00 7 13 3.75 43.00 29.00 35.75 243.000 515 280 225 27
28 93 - HAMZA ERENBALAT 10 / A 13 7 11.25 17 3 16.25 0 0 0.00 9 4 8.00 39.00 14.00 35.50 242.000 523 285 229 28
29 53 - RESUL TUNÇ 10 / B 14 10 11.50 17 6 15.50 10 9 7.75 5 18 0.50 46.00 43.00 35.25 241.000 535 291 233 29
30 257 - SUDE ESEN 10 / E 12 6 10.50 13 4 12.00 7 8 5.00 9 6 7.50 41.00 24.00 35.00 240.000 545 295 236 30
31 70 - BARAN KINAŞ 10 / B 11 10 8.50 16 4 15.00 10 6 8.50 4 6 2.50 41.00 26.00 34.50 238.000 561 300 239 31
32 243 - EYÜP S RSAKAR 10 / A 12 8 10.00 14 7 12.25 8 2 7.50 7 11 4.25 41.00 28.00 34.00 236.000 572 308 245 32
33 97 - İLAYDA KAYA 10 / C 15 8 13.00 13 3 12.25 6 7 4.25 7 10 4.50 41.00 28.00 34.00 236.000 572 308 245 32
34 67 - BURAK KATIKSIZ 10 / B 15 8 13.00 17 6 15.50 6 7 4.25 5 17 0.75 43.00 38.00 33.50 234.000 593 319 252 34
35 21 - ŞÜRA ACAR 10 / D 12 11 9.25 16 7 14.25 7 7 5.25 8 13 4.75 43.00 38.00 33.50 234.000 593 319 252 34
36 104 - MUHAMMET BÜLET 10 / C 15 8 13.00 12 9 9.75 6 8 4.00 8 7 6.25 41.00 32.00 33.00 232.000 607 327 259 36
37 189 - ENSAR KAPU 10 / A 11 9 8.75 15 8 13.00 7 5 5.75 8 10 5.50 41.00 32.00 33.00 232.000 607 327 259 36
38 174 - GAYE BÖBERCİ 10 / A 15 8 13.00 16 6 14.50 3 4 2.00 6 11 3.25 40.00 29.00 32.75 231.000 623 339 269 38
39 18 - LUTFULLAH KORLAELÇİ 10 / A 11 7 9.25 15 5 13.75 6 8 4.00 7 5 5.75 39.00 25.00 32.75 231.000 623 339 269 38
40 65 - REYYAN AYDIN 10 / B 13 4 12.00 14 5 12.75 3 2 2.50 7 7 5.25 37.00 18.00 32.50 230.000 635 345 273 40
41 206 - ZEHRA TOPRAKTAN 10 / D 11 4 10.00 12 4 11.00 6 4 5.00 7 6 5.50 36.00 18.00 31.50 226.000 675 368 291 41
42 200 - SEMA AFŞİN 10 / D 14 5 12.75 13 4 12.00 5 5 3.75 6 12 3.00 38.00 26.00 31.50 226.000 675 368 291 41
43 266 - YASİR ZENGİN 10 / E 10 7 8.25 11 8 9.00 10 5 8.75 7 6 5.50 38.00 26.00 31.50 226.000 675 368 291 41
44 96 - SEMANUR KALKAN 10 / C 13 6 11.50 12 7 10.25 6 9 3.75 8 9 5.75 39.00 31.00 31.25 225.000 686 374 295 44
45 214 - BATUHAN BULUT 10 / F 13 9 10.75 15 7 13.25 4 9 1.75 8 11 5.25 40.00 36.00 31.00 224.000 697 377 298 45
46 79 - GÖRKEM ÖNALAN 10 / C 13 8 11.00 8 5 6.75 7 2 6.50 8 6 6.50 36.00 21.00 30.75 223.000 707 380 300 46
47 23 - AYLİN ŞANLI 10 / F 15 6 13.50 11 8 9.00 6 8 4.00 6 8 4.00 38.00 30.00 30.50 222.000 717 382 301 47
48 16 - DİCLE BULUT 10 / D 9 4 8.00 9 4 8.00 12 11 9.25 6 4 5.00 36.00 23.00 30.25 221.000 724 388 306 48
49 201 - MUSTAFA TATLI 10 / D 13 10 10.50 15 10 12.50 5 9 2.75 7 11 4.25 40.00 40.00 30.00 220.000 737 392 308 49
50 40 - U EREN DURSUN 10 / E 9 13 5.75 17 3 16.25 4 5 2.75 7 8 5.00 37.00 29.00 29.75 219.000 757 403 316 50
51 50 - EYLEM ŞANLI 10 / B 12 9 9.75 12 8 10.00 6 4 5.00 7 9 4.75 37.00 30.00 29.50 218.000 777 415 325 51
52 57 - EFSA KOCAK 10 / B 15 8 13.00 12 7 10.25 7 8 5.00 4 12 1.00 38.00 35.00 29.25 217.000 793 423 330 52
53 59 - EZGİ GEDİK 10 / C 11 10 8.50 12 3 11.25 11 6 9.50 3 12 0.00 37.00 31.00 29.25 217.000 793 423 330 52
54 212 - FATMA ÖZDMR 10 / D 12 10 9.50 11 9 8.75 10 10 7.50 5 7 3.25 38.00 36.00 29.00 216.000 800 428 335 54
55 1 - OSMAN TOPAL 10 / E 10 9 7.75 14 4 13.00 7 8 5.00 5 8 3.00 36.00 29.00 28.75 215.000 812 436 341 55
56 56 - NİSA KUYULDAR 10 / F 12 7 10.25 9 3 8.25 4 3 3.25 8 5 6.75 33.00 18.00 28.50 214.000 831 447 349 56
57 248 - HAMZA ERTEN 10 / E 10 11 7.25 19 3 18.25 3 7 1.25 5 13 1.75 37.00 34.00 28.50 214.000 831 447 349 56
58 260 - ÖYKÜ GÜN EL 10 / E 14 6 12.50 11 5 9.75 3 4 2.00 5 5 3.75 33.00 20.00 28.00 212.000 863 468 368 58
59 20 - GÜLSÜM DENER 10 / A 14 5 12.75 12 6 10.50 2 2 1.50 5 7 3.25 33.00 20.00 28.00 212.000 863 468 368 58
60 136 - TUBA ERİMEZ 10 / C 18 7 16.25 14 11 11.25 0 1 -0.25 4 14 0.50 36.00 33.00 27.75 211.000 876 478 374 60
61 76 - MİRAÇ BURULDAY 10 / B 11 11 8.25 15 3 14.25 3 7 1.25 6 8 4.00 35.00 29.00 27.75 211.000 876 478 374 60
62 175 - SENA BAŞLIK 10 / A 17 8 15.00 16 9 13.75 3 16 -1.00 5 20 0.00 41.00 53.00 27.75 211.000 876 478 374 60
63 151 - YUSUF ÇÖKÜK 10 / D 12 9 9.75 10 4 9.00 5 3 4.25 6 6 4.50 33.00 22.00 27.50 210.000 890 489 383 63
64 196 - BEYTULLAH OĞRAK 10 / D 12 11 9.25 13 11 10.25 4 5 2.75 8 12 5.00 37.00 39.00 27.25 209.000 902 498 391 64
65 5 - MUHAMMED MUTLU 10 / A 9 12 6.00 8 8 6.00 12 8 10.00 8 11 5.25 37.00 39.00 27.25 209.000 902 498 391 64
66 101 - SALİH EKİN 10 / C 10 10 7.50 13 7 11.25 7 8 5.00 5 6 3.50 35.00 31.00 27.25 209.000 902 498 391 64
67 658 - ARDA SERT 10 / F 11 10 8.50 13 6 11.50 3 1 2.75 7 12 4.00 34.00 29.00 26.75 207.000 927 512 404 67
68 241 - BERRA BURKE 10 / E 7 9 4.75 11 5 9.75 5 4 4.00 9 4 8.00 32.00 22.00 26.50 206.000 938 515 407 68
69 155 - ÜVEYS SÜRMELİ 10 / D 11 6 9.50 9 8 7.00 5 9 2.75 9 7 7.25 34.00 30.00 26.50 206.000 938 515 407 68
70 150 - NURSİMA ÜZER 10 / A 11 6 9.50 13 5 11.75 4 5 2.75 3 3 2.25 31.00 19.00 26.25 205.000 961 529 418 70
71 73 - NİSA SAĞLAR 10 / F 9 10 6.50 11 2 10.50 6 2 5.50 4 2 3.50 30.00 16.00 26.00 204.000 975 538 425 71
72 224 - AZRA ALTIKULAÇ 10 / D 13 12 10.00 16 9 13.75 4 15 0.25 6 17 1.75 39.00 53.00 25.75 203.000 990 548 434 72
73 216 - BURAK ÖZDEMİR 10 / D 9 2 8.50 13 1 12.75 3 2 2.50 2 1 1.75 27.00 6.00 25.50 202.000 1005 556 441 73
74 19 - ESRA KARADENİZ 10 / A 11 10 8.50 15 8 13.00 4 3 3.25 4 15 0.25 34.00 36.00 25.00 200.000 1030 569 448 74
75 267 - EYLÜL S 10 / E 8 9 5.75 12 7 10.25 7 8 5.00 5 5 3.75 32.00 29.00 24.75 199.000 1044 579 457 75
76 26 - ZEYNEP BARAÇ 10 / F 14 10 11.50 12 11 9.25 4 5 2.75 6 19 1.25 36.00 45.00 24.75 199.000 1044 579 457 75
77 106 - ZEYNEP KATRAĞ 10 / A 9 8 7.00 15 6 13.50 5 8 3.00 5 16 1.00 34.00 38.00 24.50 198.000 1062 589 467 77
78 74 - SÜMEYYE KARABACAK 10 / F 14 6 12.50 10 10 7.50 3 5 1.75 4 6 2.50 31.00 27.00 24.25 197.000 1079 600 474 78
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79 0 - İREM KAYMAZ 10 / E 11 9 8.75 12 2 11.50 2 1 1.75 3 3 2.25 28.00 15.00 24.25 197.000 1079 600 474 78
80 0 - NURSENA BEYKONDU 10 / E 10 3 9.25 10 4 9.00 4 6 2.50 5 7 3.25 29.00 20.00 24.00 196.000 1091 608 481 80
81 9 - HASRET AKTULUN 10 / F 13 7 11.25 11 3 10.25 5 9 2.75 3 13 -0.25 32.00 32.00 24.00 196.000 1091 608 481 80
82 213 - BEYZA NUR KORKUT 10 / B 14 6 12.50 5 4 4.00 8 6 6.50 4 12 1.00 31.00 28.00 24.00 196.000 1091 608 481 80
83 227 - TAHA TUNCER 10 / C 10 14 6.50 11 13 7.75 10 7 8.25 5 14 1.50 36.00 48.00 24.00 196.000 1091 608 481 80
84 205 - EFEKAN BAHADIR 10 / E 7 10 4.50 15 2 14.50 1 1 0.75 7 11 4.25 30.00 24.00 24.00 196.000 1091 608 481 80
85 217 - ŞEYMA YÜRÜYÜCÜ 10 / D 13 12 10.00 15 8 13.00 6 9 3.75 2 20 -3.00 36.00 49.00 23.75 195.000 1111 622 491 85
86 158 - FATMANUR TAŞAR 10 / F 11 9 8.75 8 12 5.00 9 6 7.50 6 16 2.00 34.00 43.00 23.25 193.000 1137 638 503 86
87 207 - FATİH UĞUR 10 / D 12 13 8.75 13 9 10.75 4 3 3.25 4 15 0.25 33.00 40.00 23.00 192.000 1159 649 512 87
88 3 - CEMRE KORLAELÇİ 10 / B 12 10 9.50 12 13 8.75 5 10 2.50 5 12 2.00 34.00 45.00 22.75 191.000 1177 660 520 88
89 133 - İBRAHİM YALÇINKAYA 10 / F 9 7 7.25 11 4 10.00 0 0 0.00 6 2 5.50 26.00 13.00 22.75 191.000 1177 660 520 88
90 222 - RAVZA TANLA 10 / F 11 8 9.00 8 8 6.00 6 2 5.50 4 7 2.25 29.00 25.00 22.75 191.000 1177 660 520 88
91 186 - MUHAMMED KIZILARSLA 10 / D 12 13 8.75 13 6 11.50 4 4 3.00 3 15 -0.75 32.00 38.00 22.50 190.000 1194 670 529 91
92 88 - CNİAV ZÖÜRTK 10 / F 9 6 7.50 8 2 7.50 5 2 4.50 5 8 3.00 27.00 18.00 22.50 190.000 1194 670 529 91
93 37 - SELİM ALPAĞU 10 / A 12 13 8.75 14 9 11.75 2 6 0.50 5 15 1.25 33.00 43.00 22.25 189.000 1216 686 542 93
94 46 - AZRA ÇETİN 10 / D 13 11 10.25 11 10 8.50 7 12 4.00 3 14 -0.50 34.00 47.00 22.25 189.000 1216 686 542 93
95 310 - EYLÜL BUZGAN 10 / C 11 9 8.75 13 6 11.50 5 20 0.00 6 17 1.75 35.00 52.00 22.00 188.000 1234 700 552 95
96 116 - DİCLE BALANUR 10 / C 11 8 9.00 11 6 9.50 0 6 -1.50 7 8 5.00 29.00 28.00 22.00 188.000 1234 700 552 95
97 223 - EMİR GÜNERİ 10 / D 8 8 6.00 14 9 11.75 4 7 2.25 5 13 1.75 31.00 37.00 21.75 187.000 1247 709 558 97
98 60 - EREN BARIŞ 10 / B 11 10 8.50 12 9 9.75 1 12 -2.00 7 9 4.75 31.00 40.00 21.00 184.000 1300 731 573 98
99 42 - EMİR BUYRUK 10 / D 8 8 6.00 14 10 11.50 4 9 1.75 5 14 1.50 31.00 41.00 20.75 183.000 1311 736 577 99

100 237 - MERYEM BAYDOĞAN 10 / E 12 11 9.25 12 11 9.25 1 4 0.00 6 16 2.00 31.00 42.00 20.50 182.000 1331 746 585 100
101 191 - RANA E LKATMIŞ 10 / D 11 10 8.50 11 9 8.75 6 11 3.25 4 18 -0.50 32.00 48.00 20.00 180.000 1356 760 594 101
102 43 - EMİR KOMAŞ 10 / B 12 12 9.00 9 12 6.00 2 2 1.50 4 5 2.75 27.00 31.00 19.25 177.000 1402 785 613 102
103 83 - RÜMEYSA ÖVÜ 10 / C 7 11 4.25 9 5 7.75 5 8 3.00 6 7 4.25 27.00 31.00 19.25 177.000 1402 785 613 102
104 58 - İNCİ ÇETİNELLİ 10 / B 13 10 10.50 9 13 5.75 4 9 1.75 5 16 1.00 31.00 48.00 19.00 176.000 1416 791 618 104
105 208 - KADİR KIZMAZ 10 / D 9 11 6.25 12 10 9.50 3 14 -0.50 7 14 3.50 31.00 49.00 18.75 175.000 1431 801 625 105
106 209 - KADİR ERCE 10 / F 8 10 5.50 8 8 6.00 5 1 4.75 2 1 1.75 23.00 20.00 18.00 172.000 1488 830 648 106
107 233 - BUKETT EMCİ 10 / E 10 7 8.25 9 8 7.00 1 2 0.50 3 4 2.00 23.00 21.00 17.75 171.000 1510 845 656 107
108 38 - MELEK BÜRLÜKKARA 10 / E 12 11 9.25 8 16 4.00 2 1 1.75 5 9 2.75 27.00 37.00 17.75 171.000 1510 845 656 107
109 102 - SALİH ZANA 10 / C 7 6 5.50 14 7 12.25 0 0 0.00 0 0 0.00 21.00 13.00 17.75 171.000 1510 845 656 107
110 220 - EYMEN ARUK 10 / D 8 17 3.75 8 14 4.50 5 6 3.50 9 14 5.50 30.00 51.00 17.25 169.000 1545 866 671 110
111 231 - MİNÜRE 10 / E 7 10 4.50 8 13 4.75 5 8 3.00 8 12 5.00 28.00 43.00 17.25 169.000 1545 866 671 110
112 2 - ZEYNEP ATAN 10 / F 10 10 7.50 8 11 5.25 1 0 1.00 6 11 3.25 25.00 32.00 17.00 168.000 1563 876 678 112
113 258 - ESMA NUR GÜNDOĞDU 10 / E 8 10 5.50 12 9 9.75 1 4 0.00 5 14 1.50 26.00 37.00 16.75 167.000 1575 884 686 113
114 72 - HASAN KANAN 10 / F 9 13 5.75 12 13 8.75 3 8 1.00 5 16 1.00 29.00 50.00 16.50 166.000 1590 891 690 114
115 95 - SUDE BERDİBEK 10 / C 7 11 4.25 9 4 8.00 5 5 3.75 3 10 0.50 24.00 30.00 16.50 166.000 1590 891 690 114
116 190 - MERCAN 10 / D 7 15 3.25 8 7 6.25 4 8 2.00 6 10 3.50 25.00 40.00 15.00 160.000 1697 959 732 116
117 115 - ESMANUR TARTAR 10 / C 8 6 6.50 6 1 5.75 1 0 1.00 0 0 0.00 15.00 7.00 13.25 153.000 1818 1028 775 117
118 35 - AYBÜKE ZENT 10 / A 7 15 3.25 9 9 6.75 5 8 3.00 4 15 0.25 25.00 47.00 13.25 153.000 1818 1028 775 117
119 99 - EYMEN AYTEMUR 10 / F 6 9 3.75 9 7 7.25 0 2 -0.50 4 6 2.50 19.00 24.00 13.00 152.000 1838 1043 787 119
120 238 - HÜSEYİN KARAKOÇ 10 / E 4 10 1.50 9 4 8.00 0 0 0.00 4 4 3.00 17.00 18.00 12.50 150.000 1863 1057 799 120
121 108 - NİSA NASIRBEL 10 / F 6 5 4.75 9 4 8.00 1 10 -1.50 1 0 1.00 17.00 19.00 12.25 149.000 1882 1064 804 121
122 25 - BARIŞ ALAOĞLU 10 / B 8 11 5.25 6 11 3.25 2 7 0.25 4 12 1.00 20.00 41.00 9.75 139.000 2024 1156 863 122
123 181 - BARAN CEBBA 0 / F 1 15 -2.75 10 11 7.25 0 2 -0.50 4 3 3.25 15.00 31.00 7.25 129.000 2157 1236 919 123
124 116 - ZEYNEP KRKMZ 10 / Ç 6 8 4.00 2 0 2.00 0 0 0.00 0 0 0.00 8.00 8.00 6.00 124.000 2223 1270 945 124
125 228 - BAVER AĞIRBAŞ 10 / D 4 7 2.25 5 6 3.50 0 1 -0.25 0 0 0.00 9.00 14.00 5.50 122.000 2245 1284 955 125
126 204 - HİRA ÇAKIROĞLU 10 / D 3 15 -0.75 4 15 0.25 3 14 -0.50 4 12 1.00 14.00 56.00 0.00 100.000 2502 1432 1064 126


